
  (1676, Connecticut) 
     The Council has thought meet to appoint and set apart 
the 29th day of this instant June, as a day of Solemn 
Thanksgiving and praise to God for such his Goodness and 
Favour, many Particulars of which mercy might be 
Instanced, but we doubt not those who are sensible of God's 
Afflictions, have been as diligent to espy him returning to 
us; and that the Lord may behold us as a People offering 
Praise and thereby glorifying Him; the Council doth 
commend it to the Respective Ministers, Elders and people 
of this Jurisdiction; Solemnly and seriously to keep the 
same Beseeching that being persuaded by the mercies of 
God we may all, even this whole people offer up our bodies 
and souls as a living and acceptable Service unto God by 
Jesus Christ. 
 
(1789, Washington): 
      WHEREAS it is the duty of all nations to acknowledge 
the providence of Almighty God, to obey His will, to be 
grateful for His benefits, and humbly to implore His 
protection and favour; and Whereas both Houses of 
Congress have, by their joint committee, requested me "to 
recommend to the people of the United States a DAY OF 
PUBLICK THANKSGIVING and PRAYER, to be 
observed by acknowledging with grateful hearts the many 
and signal favors of Almighty God, especially by affording 
them an opportunity peaceably to establish a form of 
government for their safety and happiness:... 


